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John Kenneth Wyatt was born in Detroit, Michigan
and grew up in London, Ontario, where he attended
the University of Western Ontario, graduating in
Medicine in 1954.  While an undergraduate at
Western, Jack excelled in sports and was captain of
the Western Mustang Football Team.

Jack completed his General and Urology training
in London and joined the small Urology faculty
there in 1960.  He published one of the first papers
on the beneficial effects of chemotherapy for testis
cancer.  Dr. Wyatt steadily built the UWO Urology
Residency Programme, serving as the Programme
Director and Division Chair for 15 years.  Jack was
best known for his clinical acumen, his caring
attitude towards his patients as well as his residents.
An excellent clinical teacher, Jack was well-known
for his common touch and his sense of humor,
whether he was lecturing to medical students,
doing bedside or operating room teaching or
chatting with the janitor.  Dr. Wyatt was an active
contributor to the Royal College and the Canadian
Urological Association, serving as CUA President
in 1984.

Aside from Urology, Jack had a life-long passion
for skiing and golf and was known for some of his
antics at the CUA golf tournaments.  Dr. Wyatt is
survived by his very supportive wife Mary and
three wonderful children.  Jack will be remembered
by his former residents and colleagues as a role
model and builder of Canadian Urology.
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Jack Wyatt as "Hawkeye" during the CUA Annual
Meeting "M*A*S*H* Party" in Banff, Alberta.


